
VESTA 
MULTI-FACTOR 

AUTHENTICATION

Download Vesta Authenticator 
from your smartphone's Apple 
App Store or Google Play Store. 

Log into Vesta from your 
computer with your username 
and password. 

1.

1.
GETTING STARTED

Open Vesta Authenticator from 
your smartphone and click the 
add account icon. 

Log into Vesta from your 
computer with your username 
and password. 

2.

3.

Use Vesta Authenticator from 
your smartphone to scan the QR 
Code displaying in Vesta after 
logging in. 

4.

Vesta Authenticator

Open Vesta Authenticator from 
your smartphone and select 
Validation Currently Pending 
Approval. 

Within 30 seconds, select 
Approve.

2.

3.

Six-Digit Code 
Option

Log into Vesta from your 
computer with your username 
and password. 

1.

Open Vesta Authenticator from 
your smartphone and click the 
drop-down arrow next to your 
username. 

2.

In Vesta, click the option Enter 
Code Manually, enter the 
six-digit code displaying in Vesta 
Authenticator, and select 
Continue. 

3.

Email Option
Log into Vesta from your 
computer with your username 
and password. 

1.

In Vesta, click Receive 
Validation Code via Email and 
Send Code.  

2.

Review the email in your inbox 
and retrieve the Validation Code.

3.

Enter the validation code in 
Vesta and select Continue.4.


